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This start-to-finish, complete guide to Nuke will give you the foundations on the state-of-the-art visual
effects software used by professionals in the film and television industries. Along with the hard-won advice
and techniques from expert compositor and teacher Ron Ganbar, each chapter covers a complete lesson in
the fundamentals, with step-by-step instructions included so you can easily follow along and start using the
program right away. The projects used throughout the book are based on real-world examples of professional
productions and project files are included with each chapter so you can work through all the examples.

After discovering how to use the tools and understanding the compositing workflow, you’ll learn about basic
and advanced compositing techniques, color correction, RotoPaint, keying, and tracking, as well as more
advanced topics such as CGI and the 3D engine. In addition, you’ll learn about:

• Working with nodes and process trees

• Using CGI passes in Nuke to control 3D render looks

• Camera Tracking techniques to combine 2D and 3D elements

• Camera Projection to turn a single frame into moving images

• Gizmos and all about creating your own tools in Nuke

• Stereoscopic compositing

 Ron Ganbar has been a compositor since 1996 and visual effects instructor since 2001. He currently works
on a variety of projects as a gun for hire as compositor, consultant, VFX supervisor, and trainer. Ron was
made a “Teacher’s Trainer” by Apple for Shake in 2005 and has written, taught, and evaluated courses for
the National Film and Television School, Apple, Peachpit Press, Westminster University, and others.

"As both a talented compositor (with years of in-the-trenches experience) and an excellent teacher, Ron
Ganbar has the unique ability to make even the most difficult concepts crystal clear. If you want to get up
and running with Nuke as quickly as possible then start by buying this book!" —Ron Brinkmann, author of
The Art and Science of Digital Compositing
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From reader reviews:

Desmond Gorman:

The reserve untitled Nuke 101: Professional Compositing and Visual Effects (2nd Edition) (Digital Video &
Audio Editing Courses) is the publication that recommended to you to study. You can see the quality of the
guide content that will be shown to you. The language that author use to explained their way of doing
something is easily to understand. The copy writer was did a lot of study when write the book, so the
information that they share to you is absolutely accurate. You also might get the e-book of Nuke 101:
Professional Compositing and Visual Effects (2nd Edition) (Digital Video & Audio Editing Courses) from
the publisher to make you much more enjoy free time.

Nancy Lord:

In this period of time globalization it is important to someone to find information. The information will make
someone to understand the condition of the world. The condition of the world makes the information better
to share. You can find a lot of personal references to get information example: internet, magazine, book, and
soon. You will see that now, a lot of publisher that will print many kinds of book. Typically the book that
recommended for your requirements is Nuke 101: Professional Compositing and Visual Effects (2nd
Edition) (Digital Video & Audio Editing Courses) this e-book consist a lot of the information of the
condition of this world now. This specific book was represented how can the world has grown up. The
dialect styles that writer make usage of to explain it is easy to understand. The actual writer made some study
when he makes this book. That is why this book ideal all of you.

Linda Fite:

In this particular era which is the greater man or who has ability in doing something more are more important
than other. Do you want to become certainly one of it? It is just simple way to have that. What you should do
is just spending your time almost no but quite enough to possess a look at some books. One of many books
in the top collection in your reading list will be Nuke 101: Professional Compositing and Visual Effects (2nd
Edition) (Digital Video & Audio Editing Courses). This book that is qualified as The Hungry Mountains can
get you closer in becoming precious person. By looking way up and review this e-book you can get many
advantages.

Alex Miller:

You will get this Nuke 101: Professional Compositing and Visual Effects (2nd Edition) (Digital Video &
Audio Editing Courses) by look at the bookstore or Mall. Only viewing or reviewing it may to be your solve
trouble if you get difficulties to your knowledge. Kinds of this guide are various. Not only by simply written
or printed but additionally can you enjoy this book by simply e-book. In the modern era including now, you
just looking from your mobile phone and searching what your problem. Right now, choose your current
ways to get more information about your e-book. It is most important to arrange you to ultimately make your



knowledge are still upgrade. Let's try to choose appropriate ways for you.
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